
ITEM QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE QTY UOM PRICE
EXT. 

PRICE
QTY UOM PRICE

EXT. 

PRICE
QTY UOM PRICE

EXT. 

PRICE
QTY UOM PRICE

EXT. 

PRICE
QTY UOM PRICE EXT. PRICE

1

125 1/DZ  $       2.49  $      3,735.00 125 1/DZ  $         29.85  $       3,731.25 125 1/DZ  $         22.25  $   2,781.25 125 1/DZ  $        25.00 $3,237.50 125 1/DZ  $     25.24  $   3,155.00 125 1/DZ  $       27.69  $   3,461.25 125 1/DZ  $    26.75  $     3,343.75 

2

24 1/CS  NO BID  NO BID 24 1/CS  NO BID  NO BID 24 1/CS  $       111.60  $   2,678.40 24 1/CS  $        89.90 $2,157.60 24 1/CS  $   114.80  $   2,755.20 24 1/CS  $       92.50  $   2,220.00 24 1/CS  $  174.48  $     4,187.52 

3

50 1/DZ  $     14.50  $         725.00 50 1/DZ  $         13.30  $          665.00 50 1/DZ  $         18.20  $      910.00 50 1/DZ  $        16.90 $845.00 50 1/DZ  $     14.79  $      739.50 50 1/DZ  $       17.31  $      865.50 50 1/DZ  $    17.86  $        893.00 

4

250 1/DZ  $     10.50  $      2,625.00 250 1/DZ  $         11.34  $       2,835.00 250 1/DZ  $           8.55  $   2,137.50 250 1/DZ  $          9.90 $2,475.00 250 1/DZ  $       9.54  $   2,385.00 250 1/DZ  $       10.25  $   2,562.50 250 1/DZ  $      9.27  $     2,317.50 

5

100 1/DZ  $       2.50  $         250.00 100 1/DZ  $           1.81  $          181.00 100 1/DZ  $           3.10  $      310.00 100 1/DZ  $          1.90 $190.00 100 1/DZ  $       2.11  $      211.00 100 1/DZ  $         1.85  $      185.00 100 1/DZ  $      1.86  $        186.00 

GRAND TOTAL OF LINE ITEMS 1 - 5 7,335.00$      7,412.25$        $   8,817.15 $8,905.10  $   9,245.70  $   9,294.25  $   10,927.77 

6

PACA Required Forms

1 HR COTTON USA

2 GEM MEDICAL SUPPLIES

3 TABB TEXTILE CO., INC.

4 CHARM-TEX

5 VICTORY SUPPLY, LLC.

6 BOB BARKER COMPANY

7 ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.

YES

 ________0%__________

 ________0%__________

YESYES

 $                                   230.22 

 ________0%__________

 ________0%__________

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

 ________0%__________

 ________Up to 2%__________

YES YES

YES

YES

5%

NO

YES

YES

 $                                 143.60 29.99$                                   56.30$                                        $                                        163.70  $                                     166.48  $                                      149.60 

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

 ________15%__________

Signature Sheet

Debarment Statement

Price Sheet

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

6

BLANKETS, 40% WOOL/60% SYNTHETIC, FLAME RESISTANT, SIZE 54” X 84”, 

WEIGHT 2.6 LBS EACH OR APPROVED EQUAL

TOWELS, TERRY, COLOR BROWN, SIZE 20” X 40”, WEIGHT 5 LB PER DOZEN 

OR APPROVED EQUAL

10%

 ________5-14__________

YES

YES

YES

YES

TABB TEXTILES CO., INC.

 ________7__________ ________10__________

WASHCLOTHS, FIRST QUALITY, 100% COTTON, COLOR WHITE, SIZE 12” X 

12”, WEIGHT 0.75 LBS PER DOZEN OR APPROVED EQUAL

PRODUCT DISCOUNTS ON MISC. ITEMS (TO INCLUDE: SHEETS, BLANKETS, 

TOWELS & WASHCLOTHS) RETAIL (Minus)  -  %
0%0%

PO BOX 21056, WACO, TEXAS 76702 | JM BOGAN    P: 800.524.5424    E: BIDS@ICSWACO.COM 

7925 PURFOY ROAD, FUQUAY VARINA, NC 27526  | BETSEY COPELAND   P: 919.753.1654    E: BETSEYCOPELAND@BOBBARKER.COM

5 7

 ________5__________  ________5__________

41 2 3

0%

HR COTTON USA, INC.

0%

GEM MEDICAL SUPPLIES

YES

Affidavit of Contractor

Non-Collusion Affidavit

YESYES

YES

YES

YES YES

YES

Bid Tabulation 

ITB 47-19

Latoria Kenniebrew, Buyer

kenniebrewl@jccal.org

7025 INDUSTRIAL PARK ROAD, MOUNT PLEASANT, TN 38474| MARIAH MACHAM   P: 888.376.1205   E: MARIAH@VICTORYSUPPLYINC.COM 

511 PLEASANT DRIVE, OPELIKA, AL 36801 | ALAN FENSTER   P: 334.745.6762   E: TABB@TEXTILEGROUP.NET

YES

YES

YES

YES

NO

SHEETS, FLAT, 50% POLY/50% COTTON BLEND, COLOR WHITE, SIZE 54” X 

90” OR APPROVED EQUAL

2165 SHERNER RD, WORTHBROOK, IL 60062 | MICHAEL MONSTER   P: 848.562.9890    E:  MIKE@GEMMEDICALSUPPLIES.COM

3105 SWEET WATER ROAD, SUITE 220, LAWRENCEVILLE, GA 30044 | SHAHBA ZUDDIN   P:    E: BID@HRCOTTON.COM

1618 CONEY ISLAND AVE., BROOKLYN, NY 11230 |  STAN DANZGER  P: 718.252.8100    E: STAN@CHARM-TEX.COM

Contact Information

 ________5__________

Required Forms 

Notification of Intent 

Equal Employment Opportunity Certification Form

NO

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC.

12%

VICTORY SUPPLY, LLC BOB BARKER COMPANY

Delivery is guaranteed not later than __________ days after order date.

Guaranteed Maximum discount if contract renewed for 2nd year.  ________5%__________ ________0%__________  ________0%__________  ________3%__________  ________0%__________  ________0%__________  ________0%__________

Guaranteed Maximum discount if contract renewed for 3rd year.  ________5%__________

 ________5__________

% Mark-up for succeeding years 

 ________0%__________

LINEN (TOWELS, WASH CLOTHS, BLANKETS & FLAT SHEETS)

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES YES

DESCRIPTION OF WORK

TOWELS, FIRST QUALITY, 100% COTTON, COLOR WHITE, SIZE 20” X 40”, 

WEIGHT 4.5 LBS PER DOZEN OR APPROVED EQUAL

CHARM-TEX

Addendum I

 ________0%__________

 ________0%__________ ________0%__________  ________5%__________

 ________6%__________

mailto:kenniebrewl@jccal.org

